
DWSD STOCK 
ITEM 

NUMBER

DESCRIPTION Estimated 2-
year Quantity

Unit of Measure Pipe Class          
52 or 54 or 56

Unit Price for 18' Total Price Approximate 
Lead Time

Pipe Class          
52 or 54 or 56

Unit Price for 18' Total Price Approximate 
Lead Time

600592 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 4" X 18' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01

2268  FT 52  $              40.30  $      91,400.40 6 Weeks 52  $              37.99  $         86,161.32 3-5 DAYS

600591 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 6" X 18' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01

1188  FT 52  $              30.98  $      36,804.24 6 Weeks 52  $              29.21  $         34,701.48 3-5 DAYS

600594 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 8" X 18' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01. 

3510  FT 52  $              43.72  $    153,457.20 6 Weeks 52  $              41.22  $      144,682.20 3-5 DAYS

600590 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 10" X 18' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01

576  FT 52  $              57.30  $      33,004.80 6 Weeks 52  $              54.00  $         31,104.00 3-5 DAYS

600590 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 12" X 18' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01

918  FT 52  $              72.09  $      66,178.62 6 Weeks 52  $              68.00  $         62,424.00 3-5 DAYS

600586 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 16" X 18' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01

900  FT 52  $            104.32  $      93,888.00 6 Weeks 52  $              98.43  $         88,587.00 3-5 DAYS

600593 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 3" X 18' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01

108  FT 52  $              73.07  $        7,891.56 6 Weeks 52  $              68.94  $           7,445.52 3-5 DAYS

Ferguson

 RFB #527750 DUCTILE IRON PIPE                                                                                                                                                                                         
ATTACHMENT E - PRICE SHEET 

All pricing is to be held firm for the term of the contract. Estimated quanities are based on a 
One year period. Failure to complete the Price Page and submit with your bid is cause for 

disqualification without further evaluation. Unit Price must be all inclusive, including delivery, 
supplies, milage, etc.

NOTE: Unit pricing is per foot, but items are to be delivered in sizes listed in the description. EJ USA



TOTAL  $    482,624.82  $      455,105.52 

DWSD STOCK 
ITEM 

NUMBER

DESCRIPTION Estimated 2-
year Quantity

Unit of Measure Pipe Class          
52 or 54 or 56

Unit Price for 20' Total Price Approximate 
Lead Time

Pipe Class          
52 or 54 or 56

Unit Price for 20' Total Price Approximate 
Lead Time

10004722 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 4" X 20' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01

600  FT  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10004725 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 6" X 20' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01

1260  FT  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10004721 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 8" X 20' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01. 

1000  FT  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10004726 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 10" X 20' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01

600  FT  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10004723 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 12" X 20' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01

600  FT  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10004724 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 16" X 20' TYTON 
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD 
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01

400  FT  No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Lead  Time - _____________

EJ Clearances 
1/29/26

Ferguson 
Clearances 
12/19/25


