
Metron-Farniar Mueller Master Meter Zenner USA Badger Meter

Item No. Unit Type
Unit of 

Measure

Est. 

Quantity
 Unit Price Total Item No. Unit Type Unit of Measure Est. Quantity  Unit Price Total Item No. Unit Type

Unit of 

Measure

Est. 

Quantity
 Unit Price Total Item No. Unit Type

Unit of 

Measure

Est. 

Quantity
 Unit Price Total Item No. Unit Type

Unit of 

Measure

Est. 

Quantity
 Unit Price Total

1

5/8" Fire Line 

Meter
Each 100 No Bid

1

5/8" Fire Line 

Meter
Each 100 No Bid  No Bid

1

5/8" Fire Line 

Meter
Each 100 108.00$      10,800.00$              

1

5/8" Fire Line 

Meter
Each 100 136.31$      13,631.00$              

1

5/8" Fire Line 

Meter
Each 100

2
5/8" Each 15,000 No Bid

2
5/8" Each 15,000 $125.59 1,883,850.00$         

2
5/8" Each 15,000 $108.00 1,620,000.00$         

2
5/8" Each 15,000 90.70$         1,360,500.00$         

2
5/8" Each 15,000 102.50$      1,537,500.00$         

3
3/4" Each 2,500 No Bid

3
3/4" Each 2,500 $160.19 400,475.00$            

3
3/4" Each 2,500 $127.00 317,500.00$            

3
3/4" Each 2,500 118.57$      296,425.00$            

3
3/4" Each 2,500 120.00$      300,000.00$            

4
1” Each 1,500 No Bid

4
1” Each 1,500 $227.63 341,445.00$            

4
1” Each 1,500 $180.00 270,000.00$            

4
1” Each 1,500 122.76$      184,140.00$            

4
1” Each 1,500 175.00$      262,500.00$            

-$                       2,625,770.00$      2,218,300.00$      1,854,696.00$      2,100,000.00$      

5

1 1/2" Each 600 No Bid

5

1 1/2" Each 600 No Bid No Bid

5

1 1/2" Each 600 480.00$      288,000.00$            

5

1 1/2" Each 600 288.68$      173,208.00$            

5

1 1/2" Each 600 470.00$      282,000.00$            

6
2" Each 500 No Bid

6
2" Each 500 No Bid No Bid

6
2" Each 500 599.00$      299,500.00$            

6
2" Each 500 336.35$      168,175.00$            

6
2" Each 500 850.00$      425,000.00$            

7
3" Each 85 No Bid

7
3" Each 85 No Bid No Bid

7
3" Each 85 1,150.00$   97,750.00$              

7
3" Each 85 1,099.43$   93,451.55$              

7
3" Each 85 1,390.00$   118,150.00$            

8
4" Each 120 No Bid

8
4" Each 120 No Bid No Bid

8
4" Each 120 1,300.00$   156,000.00$            

8
4" Each 120 1,230.34$   147,640.80$            

8
4" Each 120 1,650.00$   198,000.00$            

9
6” Fire Line Each 10 No Bid

9
6” Fire Line Each 10 No Bid No Bid

9
6” Fire Line Each 10 2,099.00$   20,990.00$              

9
6” Fire Line Each 10 2,918.37$   29,183.70$              

9
6” Fire Line Each 10 2,550.00$   25,500.00$              

10
6" Each 50 No Bid

10
6" Each 50 No Bid No Bid

10
6" Each 50 2,099.00$   104,950.00$            

10
6" Each 50 1,919.17$   95,958.50$              

10
6" Each 50 2,150.00$   107,500.00$            

11
8” Fire Line Each 10 No Bid

11
8” Fire Line Each 10 No Bid No Bid

11
8” Fire Line Each 10 3,200.00$   32,000.00$              

11
8” Fire Line Each 10 -$                          

11
8” Fire Line Each 10 3,500.00$   35,000.00$              

12
8" Each 15 No Bid

12
8" Each 15 No Bid No Bid

12
8" Each 15 3,200.00$   48,000.00$              

12
8" Each 15 2,498.43$   37,476.45$              

12
8" Each 15 3,000.00$   45,000.00$              

13
10” Fire Line Each 10 No Bid

13
10” Fire Line Each 10 No Bid No Bid

13
10” Fire Line Each 10 5,800.00$   58,000.00$              

13
10” Fire Line Each 10 -$                          

13
10” Fire Line Each 10 -$                          

14
10" Each 5 No Bid

14
10" Each 5 No Bid No Bid

14
10" Each 5 5,800.00$   29,000.00$              

14
10" Each 5 3,419.26$   17,096.30$              

14
10" Each 5 -$                          

-$                       -$                       1,134,190.00$      762,190.30$         1,236,150.00$      

15

1 1/2" Each 600 625.00$         375,000.00$            

15

1 1/2" Each 600 No Bid No Bid

15

1 1/2" Each 600 No Bid No Bid

15

1 1/2" Each 600 588.62$      353,172.00$            

15

1 1/2" Each 600 625.00$      375,000.00$            

16
2" Each 500 925.00$         462,500.00$            

16
2" Each 500 No Bid No Bid

16
2" Each 500 No Bid No Bid

16
2" Each 500 570.36$      285,180.00$            

16
2" Each 500 850.00$      425,000.00$            

17
3" Each 85 1,950.00$      165,750.00$            

17
3" Each 85 No Bid No Bid

17
3" Each 85 No Bid No Bid

17
3" Each 85 1,056.70$   89,819.50$              

17
3" Each 85 -$                          

18
4" Each 120 2,950.00$      354,000.00$            

18
4" Each 120 No Bid No Bid

18
4" Each 120 No Bid No Bid

18
4" Each 120 1,479.87$   177,584.40$            

18
4" Each 120 -$                          

19
6” Fire line Each 5 11,500.00$    57,500.00$              

19
6” Fire line Each 5 No Bid No Bid

19
6” Fire line Each 5 No Bid No Bid

19
6” Fire line Each 5 -$                          

19
6” Fire line Each 5 -$                          

20
6" Each 50 3,850.00$      192,500.00$            

20
6" Each 50 No Bid No Bid

20
6" Each 50 No Bid No Bid

20
6" Each 50 2,091.00$   104,550.00$            

20
6" Each 50 -$                          

1,607,250.00$      

14

-$                       

14

-$                       1,010,305.90$      

14

800,000.00$         

Total Pricing 1,607,250.00$    2,625,770.00$    3,352,490.00$    3,627,192.20$    4,136,150.00$    

Notes Pricing for 3 yrs *deem responsible due to T&C exceptions Pricing for 2 yrs Pricing for 3yrs Pricing for 3 yrs Pricing for 1 yr

SUB-TOTAL:

Group A -Positive Displacement Meters Sizes 5/8” through 1” – Bronze (lead-free)

SUB-TOTAL:

Group B -Electronic Type Billing Meters Sizes 1.5” through 10”  

SUB-TOTAL:

Group C -Single Measuring Unit Mechanical Meters Sizes 1.5” through 6”   

SUB-TOTAL:

Group A -Positive Displacement Meters Sizes 5/8” through 1” – Bronze (lead-free)

SUB-TOTAL:

Group B -Electronic Type Billing Meters Sizes 1.5” through 10”  

SUB-TOTAL:

Group C -Single Measuring Unit Mechanical Meters Sizes 1.5” through 6”   

SUB-TOTAL:

Group B -Electronic Type Billing Meters Sizes 1.5” through 10”  

SUB-TOTAL:

Group C -Single Measuring Unit Mechanical Meters Sizes 1.5” through 6”   

SUB-TOTAL:

Group A -Positive Displacement Meters Sizes 5/8” through 1” – Bronze (lead-free)

SUB-TOTAL:

Group B -Electronic Type Billing Meters Sizes 1.5” through 10”  

SUB-TOTAL:

Group C -Single Measuring Unit Mechanical Meters Sizes 1.5” through 6”   

Group A -Positive Displacement Meters Sizes 5/8” through 1” – Bronze (lead-free)

SUB-TOTAL:

SUB-TOTAL:

Group A -Positive Displacement Meters Sizes 5/8” through 1” – Bronze (lead-free)

SUB-TOTAL:

Group B -Electronic Type Billing Meters Sizes 1.5” through 10”  

SUB-TOTAL:

Group C -Single Measuring Unit Mechanical Meters Sizes 1.5” through 6”   


