RFB #497487 lowest price out of all bidders
Meter Description Meter Type Estimated| Unit of Unit Price Extended Unit Price Unit Price Extended Unit Price Unit Price Extended Unit Price
Quanity | Measure
5/8" Cold Water Meter, Positive Displ tT ith . .
/8" Cold Water Meter, Positive Displacement Type wi Group A-Bronze | 10,000 | Each No Bid No Bid $94.50 945,000.00 $110.00 1,100,000.00
Encoder Register
3/4" Cold Water Meter, Positive Displ tT ith . .
E{l - d:r ater vieter, Fositive Displacement Type wi Group A-Bronze | 5,000 | Each No Bid No Bid $120.00 600,000.00 $118.00 590,000.00
1" Cold Water Meter, Positive Displ tT ith
Enc;’der ater vieter, Fositive Lisplacement Type wi Group A-Bronze | 2,000 | Each No Bid No Bid $160.20 320,400.00 $165.00 330,000.00
11/2" Cold Water Meter, Positive Displacement Type with . .
. c/o e P vp Group A-Bronze | 150 Each No Bid No Bid $532.89 79,933.50 $408.00 61,200.00
2" Cold Water Meter, Positive Displacement Type with . .
e 1P vp Group A-Bronze | 150 Each No Bid No Bid $761.36 114,204.00 $548.00 82,200.00
Additional charge, if any, for twenty five (25) feet of three
3 duct i ificati ttached t h insid
(3) conductor wire per specifications attached to eachinside - |\ 5 o076 | 17,300 | Each No Bid No Bid $4.20 72,660.00 $7.75 134,075.00
set meter register ordered for 5/8” through 2” meters.
Additional charge, if any, for pit set registers and five (5)
feet of th 3 duct i ificati ttached
eet of three (3) conductor wires per specifications attached |\ » pronse | 1000 | Each | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
to each pit set meter register ordered for 5/8” through 1
meters.
Additional charge, if any, for pit set registers and fifteen (15)
feet of three (3) conductor wire per specifications attached
ree (3) conductor wire per specifications att Group A-Bronze | 50 Each | No Bid No Bid $4.20 210.00 $6.75 337.50
to each pit set meter register ordered for 1.5” and 2
meters.
5/8" Cold Water Meter, Positive Displacement Type with . . .
E{]  ger P vp Group A - Plastic | 10,000 | Each No Bid No Bid $85.50 855,000.00 $114.00 1,140,000.00
3/4" Cold Water Meter, Positive Displacement Type with . . .
5{1 e P vp Group A - Plastic | 5,000 | Each No Bid No Bid $88.80 444,000.00 $122.00 610,000.00
1" Cold Water Meter, Positive Displacement Type with . . .
. Hve Lisp ypew! Group A-Plastic | 2,000 | Each No Bid No Bid $0.00 - $150.00 300,000.00
Additional charge, if any, for twenty five (25) feet of three
3 duct i ificati ttached t h insid
(3) conductor wire per specifications attached to eachinside| -\ s pjacric | 17,000 | Each No Bid No Bid $4.20 71,400.00 $7.75 131,750.00
set meter register ordered for 5/8” through 2” meters.
Additional charge, if any, for pit set registers and five (5)
feet of three (3) conductor wires per specifications attached
ree (3) _ per speciical ®%) Group A-Plastic | 1,000 | Each | NoBid No Bid $4.20 4,200.00 No Bid No Bid
to each pit set meter register ordered for 5/8” through 1
meters.
11/2" Cold Water Meter, Electronic Billing T ith i i
Enc/odero ater vieter, Hlectronic Bifiing Type wi Group B-PartA | 300 Each No Bid No Bid $437.40 131,220.00 $734.52 220,356.00
2" Cold Water Meter, Electronic Billing T ith Encod
ola Water Vieter, Electronic BITing Type WIth ENcoder 1 croup B-PartA | 300 Each No Bid No Bid $588.90 176,670.00 $825.52 247,656.00
3" Cold Water Meter, Electronic Billing Type with Encode . .
g 1vp Group B-PartA | 400 Each No Bid No Bid $1,510.80 604,320.00 $1,220.00 488,000.00
4" Cold Water Meter, Electronic Billing Type with Encoder . .
Hing 1yp Group B-PartA | 400 Each No Bid No Bid $1,842.90 737,160.00 $1,400.00 560,000.00
6" Cold Water Meter, Electronic Billing Type with Encoder . .
Ic BiTing Type wi Group B-PartA | 300 Each No Bid No Bid $2,786.40 835,920.00 $2,500.00 750,000.00




RFB #497487 lowest price out of all bidders
Meter Description Meter Type Estimated| Unit of Unit Price Extended Unit Price Unit Price Extended Unit Price Unit Price Extended Unit Price
Quanity | Measure
8" Cold Water Meter, Electronic Billing Type with Encoder
’ ic BIINg Type wi Group B-PartA | 20 Each No Bid No Bid $3,434.40 | $ 68,688.00 $3,300.00 $ 66,000.00
10" Cold Water Meter, Electronic Billing T ith Encod . .
ola Watervieter, Electronic BITing Type WIth ENCOCeT | Group B-PartA | 10 Each No Bid No Bid $000 | $ ; $5,500.00 $ 55,000.00
Additional charge, if any, for twenty five (25) feet of three
3) conductor wire per specifications attached to each inside
G) . per sp ” ” Group B - Part A 1,730 Each No Bid No Bid $4.20 S 7,266.00 $7.75 S 13,407.50
set meter register ordered for 1.5” through 10” meters.
Additional charge, if any, for pit set registers and fifteen (15)
feet of three (3) conductor wires per specifications attached
ree (3) conductor wires per specificati °Y| GroupB-PartA | 100 Each | NoBid No Bid $420 | 420.00 $6.75 $ 675.00
to each pit set meter register ordered for 1.5” through 10
meters.
Additional ch f h electroni t dered that i
Honatcharge for each electronic meter ordered that 15 |- g partB | 130 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 1 1/2" Ultrasonic
Additional charge for each electronic meter ordered that is . . . . . .
) . i " . Group B - Part B 130 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 1 1/2" Magnetic
Additional ch f h electroni t dered that i
Honatcharge for each electronic meter orderedtnatis | ¢ o p-part8 | 160 Each | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 2" Ultrasonic
Additional ch f h electroni t dered that i
Honatcharge for each electronic meter ordered that1s |-y g -partB | 160 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 2" Magnetic
Additional charge for each electronic meter ordered that is . . . . . .
. . i " . Group B - Part B 50 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 3" Ultrasonic
Additional ch f h electroni t dered that i
Honatcharge for each electronic meter oraered that 15 1 & oup B-PartB | 50 Each | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 3" Magnetic
Additional ch f h electroni t dered that i
Honatcharge for each electronic meter orderedthatis | o o g-partB | 50 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 4" Ultrasonic
Additional charge for each electronic meter ordered that is . . ) . . .
, . i " . Group B - Part B 50 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 4" Magnetic
Additional charge for each electronic meter ordered that is
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 6" fire line Group B-PartB 6 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ultrasonic
Additional charge for each electronic meter ordered that is
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 6" fire line Group B - Part B 6 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Magnetic
Additional charge for each electronic meter ordered that is . . . . . .
. . . " . Group B - Part B 20 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 6" Ultrasonic
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Additional ch f h electroni t dered that i

Honatcharge for each electronic meter orderedtnat s 1 g oupB-PartB | 20 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 6" Manetic
Additional charge for each electronic meter ordered that is
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 8" fire line Group B - Part B 6 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ultrasonic
Additional charge for each electronic meter ordered that is
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 8" fire line Group B - Part B 6 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Magnetic
Additional ch f h electroni t dered that i

Honatcharge for each electronic meter orderedtnat s 1 g oupB-PartB | 10 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 8" Ultrasonic
Additional ch f h electroni t dered that i

Honatcharge for each electronic meter ordered that s 1 o o g -partB | 10 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 8" Magnetic
Additional charge for each electronic meter ordered that is
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 10" fire line Group B - Part B 4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ultrasonic
Additional charge for each electronic meter ordered that is
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 10" fire line Group B-PartB 4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Magnetic
Additional ch f h electroni t dered that i

Honal cnarge for each €lectronic meter oraerednatis | - ¢ 5 up B - Part B 4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 10" Ultrasonic
Additional charge for each electronic meter ordered that is . . . . . .

) . i " . Group B - Part B 4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
equipped with a field replaceable battery, 10" Magnetic
11/2" Cold Water Meter, Single Mechanical Type with . .
. C/o o ' ingle Viechanical Type wi Group C 300 Fach | $595.00 178,500.00| $851.70 255,510.00 No Bid No Bid
2" Cold Water Meter, Single Mechanical Type with Encoder Group C 300 Each $875.00 262,500.00| $889.50 266,850.00 No Bid No Bid
3" Cold Water Meter, Single Mechanical Type with Encoder Group C 400 Each $1,850.00 740,000.00| $1,074.30 429,720.00 No Bid No Bid
4" Cold Water Meter, Single Mechanical Type with Encoder Group C 400 Each $2,850.00 1,140,000.00] S1,603.50 641,400.00 No Bid No Bid
6" Cold Water Meter, Single Mechanical Type with Encoder Group C 300 Each $3,450.00 1,035,000.00| $3,663.30 1,098,990.00 No Bid No Bid
Additional charge, if any, for twenty five (25) feet of three
(3) conductor wire per specifications attached to each inside Group C 1,700 Each No Bid No Bid $4.20 7,140.00 No Bid No Bid
set meter register ordered for 1.5” through 10” meters.
Additional charge, if any, for pit set registers and fifteen (15)
feet of three (3) conductor wires per specifications attached

(3) conductor wires per specificati Group C 100 Each No Bid No Bid $4.20 420.00 No Bid No Bid

to each pit set meter register ordered for 1.5” through 10"
meters.
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