RFB #529376 DUCTILE IRON PIPE 20 Feet
ATTACHMENT E - PRICE SHEET

CivicBridges

Core & Main

ETNA Supply

DWSD STOCK
ITEM
NUMBER

DESCRIPTION

Estimated 1-
year Quantity

Unit of Measure

Pipe Class
52 or 54 or 56

Unit Price for
20'

Total Price

Approximate
Lead Time

Pipe Class
52 or 54 or 56

Unit Price for
20'

Total Price

Approximate
Lead Time

Pipe Class
52 or 54 or 56

Unit Price for
20'

Total Price

Approximate
Lead Time

10004722

PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 4" X 20' TYTON
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD
SPECIFICATION #5X-658-01

600

FT

s 49.61

S 29,766.00

45 Days

52

$ 37.98

22,788.00

3-7 Days

52

$ 38.55

$ 23,130.00

10-14 Days

10004725

PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 6" X 20' TYTON
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD
SPECIFICATION #5X-658-01

1260

FT

s 37.12

S 46,771.20

45 Days

52

$ 29.20

36,792.00

3-7 Days

52

$ 29.65

$ 37,359.00

10-14 Days

10004721

PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 8" X 20' TYTON
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD
SPECIFICATION #SX-658-01.

1000

FT

No Bid

No Bid

52

S 41.19

41,190.00

3-7 Days

52

$ 41.85

$ 41,850.00

10-14 Days

10004726

PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 10" X 20' TYTON
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD
SPECIFICATION #5X-658-01

600

FT

No Bid

No Bid

52

S 54.01

32,406.00

3-7 Days

52

$ 54.85

$ 32,910.00

10-14 Days

10004723

PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 12" X 20' TYTON
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD
SPECIFICATION #5X-658-01

600

FT

No Bid

No Bid

52

S 68.00

40,800.00

3-7 Days

52

$ 69.00

$  41,400.00

10-14 Days

10004724

PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 16" X 20' TYTON
JOINT CLASS 56 BELL & SPIGOT IN
ACCORDANCE WITH DWSD
SPECIFICATION #5X-658-01

400

FT

No Bid

No Bid

52

S 98.43

39,372.00

3-7 Days

52

$ 100.00

S 40,000.00

10-14 Days

Clearances
3/11/26

$

213,348.00

Clearances
4/7/26




