RFB #498715-A DUCTILE IRON PIPE

All pricing is to be held firm for the term of the contract. Estimated quanities are based on a One year period. Failure to complete the Price Page and submit with your bid is cause for disqualification without further evaluation. Unit Price must be all inclusive,
including delivery, supplies, milage, etc.

NOTE: Unit pricing is per foot, but items are to be delivered in sizes listed in the description.

Ferguson Water Works

T & N Services Inc

DWSD STOCK DESCRIPTION Estimated 1-year Unit of Pipe Class Unit Price for Total Price Approximate Lead Pipe Class Unit Price Total Price App! Lead lized Credit lized Unit Extended
ITEM NUMBER Quantity Measure | 52 or54 or56 18' Time 52 or 54 or 56 for 18' Time Unit Price (2%) Price Equalized Price
600593 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 3" X 18" 54 FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54 S 87.45($ 4,722.30 9 months + S 175] $ 85.70| $ 4,627.85
600592 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 4" X 18" 1260 FT 52 S 36.00( S 45,360.00 | 20 - 30 WEEKS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
600591 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 6" X 18" 8820 FT 52 S 28.00| $ 246,960.00 [ 20 - 30 WEEKS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
600594 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 8" X 18" 5058 FT 52 S 39.00( $ 197,262.00 | 20 - 30 WEEKS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
600590 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 10" X 18" 576 FT 52 S 52.00| $ 29,952.00 [ 20-30 WEEKS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
600590 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 12" X 18' 252 FT 52 S 65.00 [ $ 16,380.00 [ 20 - 30 WEEKS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
600586 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 16" X 18" 720 FT 52 S 94.00| $ 67,680.00 [ 20 -30 WEEKS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18' Section Total $ 603,594.00 $ 4,722.30 $ 4,627.85
DWSD STOCK DESCRIPTION Estimated 1-year Unit of Pipe Class Unit Price for Total Price Approximate Lead Pipe Class Unit Price Total Price App Lead i Credit i Unit jed
ITEM NUMBER Quantity Measure | 52 or54 or56 20" Time 52 or 54 or 56 for 20" Time Unit Price (2%) Price Equalized Price
10004824 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 3" X 20" 60 FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10004722 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 4" X 20" 1240 FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54 S 72.05| $ 89,342.00 9 months + S 1.44| S 7061 S 87,555.16
10004725 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 6" X 20" 8800 FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54 S 56.21| $ 494,648.00 9 months + S 1.12] S 55.09 | $ 484,755.04
10004721 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 8" X 20" 5060 FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54 S 7857 $ 397,564.20 9 months + S 157| $ 77.00| $ 389,612.92
10004726 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 10" X 20" 600 FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54 S 102.04( $ 61,224.00 9 months + S 2.04] S 100.00 | $ 59,999.52
10004723 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 12" X 20" 260 FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54 S 126.71( $ 32,944.60 9 months + S 253 s 124.18| S 32,285.71
10004724 PIPE, DUCTILE IRON: 16" X 20" 720 FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54 S 180.61| $ 130,039.20 9 months + S 361 S 177.00| $ 127,438.42

20' Section Total

$ -

$  1,205,762.00

$ 1,181,646.76

Total Both Sections

$  603,594.00

Total Both Sections

$ 1,210,484.30

Total Equalized Both Sections

$ 1,186,274.61
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