Group A -Positive Displacement Meters Sizes 5/8” through 2” — Bronze (lead-free)
Metron-Farnier

Badger Meter, Inc

EJ Prescott

Zenner

Estimated
ltem# Meter Size Contr(a:-tvg::ntlty C(:Jsct)lr\)ner Total Cost C(:Jsct)lr\)ner Total Cost Cost per UOM Total Cost C(:Jsct)lr\)ner Total Cost C(:Jsct)lr\)ner Total Cost
Projection)
1 5/8" Fire Line Meter 200 NO BID NO BID S 54.00 | S 10,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 5/8" 40,000 S 59.36 | $ 2,374,400.00 | S 54.00| S 2,160,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 49.57 | S 1,982,800 | Zenner and EJ Prescott Disqualified
3 3/4" 7,200 S 7165|$ 515,880.00 | S 74.00 | S 532,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 53.57| S 385,704 | Zenner Disqualified
4 1” 2,400 S 95.25| $ 228,600.00| S 104.00]|S 249,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 98.88| S 237,312
Group B - Electronic Type Billing Meters Sizes 1.5” through 10”
Estimated
Item# | Meter Size Type Contr:n;:{?::ntnty C?Js(t):\)/ler Total Cost Cc:js(t):\)/ler Total Cost Cost per UOM Total Cost C?Js(t):\)/ler Total Cost Cc:js(t):\)/ler Total Cost
Projection)
1a 11/2" Ultrasonic 260 S 380.00| S 98,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1b Magnetic 260 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 681.81|S 177,270.60 NO BID NO BID
2a o Ultrasonic 320 S 512.00| S 163,840.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 516.10| S 165,152
2b Magnetic 320 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 73295]|S 234,544.00 NO BID NO BID
3a 3 Ultrasonic 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 550.02|S 55,002
3b Magnetic 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1,64790 | $ 164,789.80 NO BID NO BID Zenner Disqualified
4a 4 Ultrasonic 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 59798] S 59,798
4b Magnetic 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,943.44 | S 194,344.00 NO BID NO BID Zenner Disqualified
5a 6 Fire Line Ultrasonic 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5b Magnetic 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 3,382.10| S 40,585.20 NO BID NO BID
6a 6" Ultrasonic 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6b Magnetic 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 2,886.65| $ 115,465.92 | S 2,139.57 | S 85,583 |Zenner Disqualified
7a 8" Fire Line Ultrasonic 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7b Magnetic 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 4,419.72 | S 53,036.59 NO BID NO BID
8a g" Ultrasonic 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8b Magnetic 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 4,307.081] S 86,141.60 | S 2,432.60| S 48,652 |Zenner Disqualified
9a 10” Fire Line Ultrasonic 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9b Magnetic 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10a 10" Ultrasonic 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10b Magnetic 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 8,465.90| S 67,727.20 | S 3,154.26 | S 25,234 |Zenner Disqualified
Group C- Single Measuring Unit Mechanical Meters Sizes 1.5” through 6”
Estimated
ltem# Meter Size COntr:\;:IS:fntlty Cczjsélr\)/ler Total Cost Cczjsélr\)ner Total Cost Cost per UOM Total Cost Cczjsélr\)/ler Total Cost Cczjsélr\)/ler Total Cost
Projection)
1 11/2" 260 S 554.00(S 144,040.00| $ 411.00| S 106,860.00 | S 545.00 | S 141,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 2" 320 S 689.00|S 220,480.00| $ 460.00| S 147,200.00 | S 825.00 | S 264,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 3" 100 S 819.00| S 81,900.00 | S 1,100.00 | S 110,000.00 | S 1,450.00 | S 145,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 4" 100 $ 1,154.00 | S 115,400.00 | S 1,850.00 | $ 185,000.00 | S 1,950.00 | S 195,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 6” Fire line 12 S 4,074.00| S 48,888.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 6" 40 $ 2,929.00| S 117,160.00 | S 3,250.00 | S 130,000.00 | S 5,650.00 | S 226,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
S 3,744,868.00 S 264,860.00 S 722,090.31 Disqualified

Total 4-Year Cost

4,731,818.31
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